State of Oklahoma

Office of Management and Enterprise Services
Division of Capital Assets Management
Construction and Properties Department

BID TABULATION SHEET

CAP Project Name: New Cart Storage Building-Lake Murray CAP Project Number: 12308
Project Location: Lake Murray Golf Course-Ardmore, OK Bid Date: 11/08/12
Using Agency: Oklahoma Tourism & Recreation Department

Bidder's Name DIVERSIFIED CONSTRUCTION HOEY CONSTRUCTION MID-PLAINS CONSTRUCTION,

OF OKLAHOMA, INC. COMPANY INC.

City, State EDMOND, OK TULSA, OK DURANT, OK
Notes

Bid Security Yes X No Yes X No Yes X No
Affidavits Yes X No Yes X No Yes X No
Sighature Yes X No Yes X No Yes X No
Addenda Received 3 3 3

Days 150 150 150

Base Bid $409,000.00 $371,998.00 $334,500.00

UNIT PRICE PER CUBIC YARDS

Unsuitable Soil Excavation $6.70 $415.00 $15.00

Suitable Soil Installation $6.70 $20.00 $30.00

Rock Excavation $7.61 $138.00 $500.00
:gglr/ze‘;;atgizzzlks lpjz:lir;‘eglailwiz)ozeﬁ $21900 $1lloo $20000

5" F.R. Conc. Paving w/ #4 re-bar at

e por dell gagn - orener ™ $370.00 $386.00 $165.00

. ) ORION CONSTRUCTION CEDAR RIDGE GENERAL

Bidder's Name MIDWAY CONSTRUCTION INC. SERVICES CORP. CONTRACTING, LLC
City, State ARDMORE, OK OKC, OK WOODWARD, OK
Notes

Bid Security Yes X No Yes X No Yes X No
Affidavits Yes X No Yes X No Yes X No
Signature Yes X No Yes X No Yes X No
Addenda Received 3 3 3

Days 150 150 150

Base Bid $306,886.00 $249,163.00 $433,579.41

UNIT PRICE PER CUBIC YARDS

Unsuitable Soil Excavation $4.50 $38.28 NO BID

Suitable Soil Installation $19.00 $52.20 NO BID

Rock Excavation $127.00 $58.25 NO BID

2garogate boss AS per derail #R002 $111.00 $441.28 NO BID

5" F.R. Conc. Paving w/ #4 re-bar at

16"0.c. ea. Way Over 5" granular fill 145.00 $495.72 NO BID

as per detail 8/A101
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